RESOLUTION NO. 77-2021
Introduced by Trey Hardy

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO AWARD THE BID AND
AUTHORIZE THE EXPENDITURE OF FUNDS FOR THE PURCHASE OF WATER
TREATMENT CHEMICALS TO BONDED CHEMICALS, INC. IN AN AMOUNT NOT
TO EXCEED FIFTY-NINE THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY-FOUR AND
XX/100 DOLLARS ($59,984.00)

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HURON, OHIO:

SECTION 1. That the City of Sandusky having advertised for bids on behalf of the City
of Huron and other entities, has provided a final bid tabulation indicating the lowest and best bid
for each chemical and that based on that tabulation, the City Manager is authorized and directed
to award the bid and expenditure of funds for the purchase of 8 Tons of Powdered Activated
Carbon (in an amount not to exceed Fifteen Thousand One Hundred Eighty-Four and xx/100
Dollars ($15,184.00)) and 4,000 Gallons of Sodium Permanganate (in an amount not to exceed
Forty-Four Thousand Eight Hundred and xx/100 Dollars ($44,800.00)) to Bonded Chemicals,
Inc. in a total amount not to exceed Fifty-Nine Thousand Nine Hundred Eighty-Four and xx/100
Dollars ($59,984.00), bid in the form of Exhibit “A™ attached hereto and made a part hereof.

SECTION 2. That this Council hereby finds and determines that all formal actions
relative to the adoption of this Resolution were taken in an open meeting of this Council and that
all deliberations of this Council and of its Committees, if any, which resulted in formal action,

were taken in meetings open to the public in full compliance with applicable legal requirements,
including O.R.C. §121.22.

SECTION 3. That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and immediately
after its adoption.

=
Sam Artino, Mayénr

ATTEST: QL-L\,; LUM‘V%&&
\ J Clerk of Council
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CITY OF SANDUSKY, HURON AND ERIE COUNTY
CHEMICALS FOR CALENDAR YEAR 2022
|
ITEM NO. CHEMICAL DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST
X 0 7Y
1 Liquld Sodlum Permanganate (NaMnQ,) 12,000 Gallons More or Less S 10.20/ Gallon ¢ 122,400.00
4,000 Gation - 41,000 Lb. Minimum Defivery i
2 |Hydrofluosilicic Acld (H,SiFe) 17,000 Gallons More or tess  |[§  2.32/Gallon s 39,440.00 ‘
3.500 . 33,000 Lb. Minimum Detrve:
3 Isodlum Hydraxide Liguid (NaOH) £31660 Galfons More or Lesy' " | 2:80/ Gallon s 140.000.00
4,500 Gathon Minimum Delivery
4__|sodium Hypochlorite (Naoc1) 90,000 Gallons More or Less __|s 133/ Gallon 119,700.00
S Aluminum Sulfate Polymer Blend - Liquid (Type  [101,500 Gallons More or Less/ 600 o 8t
ﬁ 5 one) ( Ala(5°4)n) Wet Tons N Ro 8id s 0 Bi
30.060 Lb Minimum (elivery
O| 6 _|powdered Activated carbon (PAC) 123,000 Pounds More ortess s 5 87/1b- s 10701000
U 350,000 Pounds More or Less Ory
S 7 Ferraus Chioride Solution (FeC12) Weight __ $/dry [bs of Fe §  hobud $ Ko Bid 3
K ;
\4 8 polymer - Liquid 88,000 Pounds More or Less S HNo Bid $ Na Bid
9 Irerrous chloride Sotution (Fe12) 25,000 Gallons Moreoriess  Js Mo Is Mowid
: 16,000 Gallons More or Less in bulk o 51 NoBid
1, 1, ]
) 10 [Sodium - Uquid loads and/or 300 gallon totes $
£ 7,000 Gallons in 300 Gallon Totes 200
1.93/ Gallon
Gallons in 15 Gallon Drums More or . 13,510.00
c 11 __isodium Bisulfite Solution (Reducite) Less S Memo s 18
3 15,000 Gallons in 300 Gallon Totes
2,700 Gallons in 50 Gatlon Drums
g 1.44 / Gafh
¥ 2,600 Gallons In 15 Gallon Drums _ / Gatlon 823200
Y 12 |Sodium Hypochlorite (NaOCI) More or Less S Memo Deposits $ ‘
10,000 Pounds more or less
13 |Polymer- Liquid in 2,300 Pound Totas $ _ NoBid $ No Bid
28,000 Pounds More or Less $/Ibs 125/tb !
35,000.00
Deposit fee per 150 [b. cyclinder, if ‘
14 |Liquid Chiorine (CL,) applicable $__ Memo Degosits S \
15 |Powdered Activated Carbon (PAC) 8 Tons Mare or Less s 1.898.00/Ton s 1518400

Updated 87232021
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17,760.00
No Bid
22,640.00
44,800.00
No Bid
23,040.00
5,400.00
No Bid
No Bid
7.344.00
8,685.00

Is
ls

1.48 / Gallon
2.83/ Gallon
11.20/ Gallon
3.20/ Gallon
sits
1.44 / Gallon
1.93 / Gatlon

30/ 1tb.
S Memo

No Bid

No 8id

Nowis

No Bid
Mo Big

£
S
S
S
S
S
S
S

Y

8,000 Gallons More or Less

Totes More or Less _|$

1,800 Gallon Minimum Detivery
4,000 Gallons More or Less
150 tb. Net Poly Drum
18,000 Pounds More or Less
CITY-BF-3

1,800 Galon Minimumm Delive:

=)

1,800 Gallon Minimum Delivery

7,200 Gallons More or Less.

3,000 Gakien Minimum Delivery

12,000 Gallons More or Less

12,000 Gallons More or less

12,000 Pounds More or Less

250,000 Pounds More or Less

20,000 Gallons More or Less
17 (300 gallon) Totes More or Less |S
15 (300 gallon} Totes More or Less

10 (275 gatlion

CITY OF SANDUSKY, HURON AND ERIE COUNTY
CHEMICALS FOR CALENDAR YEAR 2022

_Z;'ail ddress: cochranps@chemgroue com o hary@chemgioup com

[~~~/ [ oA

ders: R00-243 7655

2

2645 Charter Street  Columbyus CH 43228

Bonded Chemicals, Inc.

fuminum Chioride Solution

Do not leave any boxes blank. if not bidding an item, state in cost box.

Liquid Sodium Permanganate (NaMnO,)
See spacifications for exact detalls

Fax Number: 614-777-92G)

Telephone Number: £14-277.9240 0,
Date:

(AL,(OH);Cl)

Hydrofluosilicic Acd {H,SIF)
Uguid Caustlc Soda - 50% NaOH
Liquid Ferrous Chioride

Bldder Name:

Bidder Address:

Pal

22 [Hydrofiuosllicic Acid - 25%

20 Chiorine (CLa)
25 __|Clarifloc CE-1593 Polymer
Updated 8/23/2021

17
18
21
23
24

19
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CITY OF SANDUSKY
BID GUARANTY AND CONTRACT, BOND

(Section 153.571, Ohio Revised Code)

KNOW ALL PERSONS BY THESE PRESENTS. that we, the undersigned

—Bonded Chemicals, Inc,, 2645 Charter Street, Columbus, OH 43228 .
(Name and Address)
as Principal, and __Travolers Casually and Surety Company of Ametica .
(Name of Surety)

as Surety. are hereby held and firmly bound unto the City of Sandusky. Ohio. as Obligee, in the
penal sum of the doliar amount of the bid submitted by the Principal to the Obligee on
October 14 . 20,21, to undertake the Praject known as:

Chemicals FY 2022

The penal sum referred to herein shall be the dollar amount of the Principal®s bid to the
Obligee. incorporating any additive Alternate bids proposals made by the Principal on the date
referred to above to the Obligee, which are accepted by the Obligee. In no case shall the penal
sum exceed the amount of Dollars ($ ). {If the

above lines are left blank, the penal sum will be the full amount of the Principal’s hid,
including additive Alternates. Altematively, if completed, the amount stated must not be less
than the full amount of the bid, including additive Alternates, in dollars and cents. A
PERCENT, IS NOT ACCEPTABLE.). For the payment of the penal sum well and truly to
be made, we hereby jointly and severally bind ourselves, our heirs, executors. administrators,
successors, and assigns.

THE CONDITION OF THE ABOVE OBLIGATION 1S SUCH that whereas the above-
named Principal has submitted a bid for the above-referenced Projeet;

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal
fails to cnter into a proper Contract n accordance with the Contract Documents. including the
bid, Plans, Specifications and details; and in the event the Principal pays to the Obligee the
difference, not to exceed 109 of the penal sum hereof, between the amount specified in the bid
and such larger amount for which the Obligee may in good faith contract with the Bidder
determined by the Obligee 10 be the next lowest and best Bidder to perform the Work covered by
the bid: or in the event the Obligee docs not award the Contract to such next lowest and best
Bidder and resubmits the Contract for bidding, the Principal pays to the Obligee the difference
not 10 exceed 10%% of the penal sum hereof, between the amount specified in the bid, or the costs,
in connection with the resubmission, of printing new Contract Documents, required advertising,
and printing and mailing notices to prospective Bidders, whichever is less, then this obligation

246337 IXK.2E CITY-CB-1




shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in full force and eifect. Hf the Obligee accepts the bid
of the Principal and the Principal within 10 days after written notice of intent to award the
Contract executes the C :t Form in accord: with the Contrict Documents, including the
bid, Plans. Specifications and details, which said Contract is made a part of this Bond the same
as though set forth hercin:

NOW ALSO, IF THE SAID Principal shall well and faithfully perform each and every
condition of such Contract; and indemnity the Obligee against all damage suffered by failure to
perform such Contract according to the provisions thereof and in accordance with the Conwract
Documents. including the Plans, Spccifications and details therefor; and shall pay all tawtul

AA. ial

claims of Sub 3 ppliers. and laborers for labor performed and materials
fumnished in the carrying forward. performing, or completing of said C 5 we agrecing and

assenting that this undertaking shall be for the benefit of any Subcontractor, Material Supplicr or
laborer having a just claim, as well as for the Obligee herein; then this obligation shall be void,
otherwise the same shall remain in tull force and crfect: it being expressly understood and agreed
that the liability of the Surety for any and all claims hercunder shall in no event exceed the penal
sum of this obligation as herein stated.

THE SAID Surcty hercby stipulates and agrees that no modifications, omissions. or
additions in or to the terms of the said Contract, the Work thereunder or the Contract Documents,
including the Plans and Specifications therefor shail in anyway affect the obligations of said
Surcty on this Bond, and the Surcty docs hereby waive notice of any such modifications,
omissions or additions in or to the terms of the Contract, the Werk or the Contract Documents,
including the Plans and Specifications.

1203633200023 CITY-CB-2

SIGNED Fhis __14th day of __ October

PRINCIPAL:

BY: .
TITLE: Paul W, Cochran
nelat
SURETY: Jravelers Casualty and Surety Company
of Amenca

BY: /&-bu{.ax( 2. ‘,{t’-ﬂp €L
Attorney-in-Fadt | -
Susan A. Yeazel ™’

SO2IBRIINKC2: CITY-CB-3

SURETY ADDRESS:

One Tower Square
Street

Hartford cT 08183
City State Zip

018 §43-2417
Telephone Number

SURETY AGENT'S ADDRESS:

USH Insurance Services LLC

Agency Name

J2FEImStget Suite 2400
Street

OH 45202
City State Zip
§13) 964-1015

Telephone Number




| Travelers Casualty andns_ﬁl-'ﬁiymcémﬁ;ﬁv of America
- Travelers C Ity and Surety Comp

.
TRAVELERS! o St Paul Fire and M

POWER OF ATTORNEY
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS That Travelars Casunily and Surety Company of Amera, Travebors Casuntty snd Surly Company, and
St Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Compsny are corporations duly omanized under tho laws of Ihe State of Connectout (heren
coectively called the "Comgpanes™, and thal the Companies do nereby make, consitute and appoint  SUSAN A YEAZELL of
CINCINNATI Ohio ther wue and iawhe Atlomep(skin-Fact to sgn  executs.  seal and
acknowladge any and Al bonds.  recognizances. conditonal undenakings and other wrlings obigatory i the natute therec! an bebail of
the Companies in their busingss of guarantosing the felly of persons, quaranieeing o perormance ol convacls and sxeculing o
guaranteeng tonds and underlaxings reguimed or permited 0 any admns or proceecings allowed by law

Insurance C:

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Companies bave caused this nstrument o be signed, and thair corparate Seals 1o be hoelo affixed, this 218t gay of April,

2021
T
&
= Y W )
State of Conapcticut . M //
By % 7’/

City of Hartford ss. Robert L RaneyFSenor Vice President

Cn this the 21st day of Aprl 2021, before me porsonally appsared Robert L. Raney, who acknowledged hwmsedf to Le the Senior
Vice President of esch of the Compantes. and hat he, as such, being authorzed so 10 do, éxecuted o foregoing Instrument for the

purposes thenen comtained by signing on behal of said Compantes by mosell as a duly aothorizod offiver
F it

Anna P Nowi, Notary Public

IN WITNESS WHEREOF | hareunto sat my hand and official sea
My Commission expires the 30th day of June. 2026

This Power of Atomey 1s granted undaer and by the authority of the following resofutions adopted by the Boards of Directurs of each of
e Companias, which rosolutions am now in full force and effect, mading as follows

RESOLVED, that the Crarman. the Pmsident. any Vice Charman, any Executve Vice Presdent. any Senior Vice Presdent any Ve
President, any Second Vice President. the Treasurer, any Assistant Treasurer, the Corporate Secrotaty or any Assstant Secrelary may appoint
Attorneys-in-Fact and Agents to act for and on behatt of the Company and may give such appointpe such sutnonty as his or her certificate of authonity
may prescribe to sgn with the Company's name and seal with the Company's seal bonds, recognizances. contracts of imdemnity, and other writings
obligatory i the nature of a band, racoghizance, or condional urdertaking, and anv of said officers o the Board of Directors at any Ume may
mmave @y such appoinies and revoke the power given him or ner, and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, ‘hat the Chawman, the Presdent, any Vice Chairman. any Eaecutive Vice Presdent ony Sznior Ve Pesicent or
any Yice President may delegate all or any pant of the foregong authorily 0 one of more officers or empioyees of this Compony, provsded
that each such delegation is in writng and a copy thereo! 1 filed 0 the offca of the Secretary, anc it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, thal any bond, recognizance, conitract of moemnity, or wrifing cobgatory in the nature of a bond mecognizanca,
or condftional undertaking anall be vald and binding upon the Company when (a) mgned by the Presdent, any Vice Chairman, any Executve
Vice President, any Berior Vice President of any Vica Prosdent. any Secong Vice President. the Treasurer. any Assistant Treasurer the
Comoray Secratary of any Assistant Secretary and duly allested ang sealed with the Company's seal by a Secietary or Assisiant Sectetary,
or (b} duly executed (under seal. o required] by one or more Allomeys-n-Foct and Agenis pursuant to the power prescribed in his or her
cartificate or their certficates of authonty or by one or more Compary oficers pursuant o a writter: Celegation of authonty, and Ris

FURTHER RESCLVED, that the signature of each of the foilowing officers: President. any Execulive Vice Present. sny Senior Vice President,
any Vice Presigant, any Asssiant Vice Premdant, any Secratary, any Assistant Secralary, and the seal of the Company may be affxed by facsimie
any Power of Allarney of 1o any cerlificate relating themlo appoirting Resident Vice Presidents, Resdent Assistonl Secretanes or Allomeys-in-
Fact for purposes only of secuting and attesting bonds and undertakngs and other wiitings obBigatory in the nature thereof. and any such Power of
Attorney of certificate beanng such facsimile Signature of facsimire seal shall be valid and binding upon the Company and any such powsr %0 execuied
and certifiad by such hacsimie signature and facswmio sool shad be vaid and bindng on the Company n the future with respect o any bond of
understandirg to which 1t is altached

t Kevin E. Hughes t(ho undersigned, Assistant Secretary of each of tha Companies. do horeby certly tha
tese and compct copy of the Powar of Allomoy axeculed by sad Compannes, which remains in it force and effact

¢ abave and foregong o a

Datod this 14t gay ot October | 2021

Co &

¥ [Cavin E. Hughes, Assibiant Secetary

To verify the authenticity of this Fower of Attorney, please call us at 1-800-421-3880.
Please refer to the above-named Attorney(s)-in-Fact and the details of the bond to which this Power of Attorney is attached.

Office of Risk Assassment Ohio Department of Insurance
50 West Town Street
Third Floor - Suite 300 Mixe DeWine - Governor

Celumbus, Ohio 43215

(5‘-4}644'2655 Judith French - Direclor
Fax(614)644-3256 g
woww.insurance.ohio.gov Certificate of Compliance

Issued 037082021
Elfective (3/0272021
Expires (4/012022
1, dudith French, hereby certily that Fam the Director of Insurance in the State of Ohio and have supervision of
msurance business in suid State and as such Thereby cenify that
TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY OF AMERICA

of Connectieut 1s duly orgamized under the Faws of this State and is authorized 1o transact the business of insurance
under the following section{s) of the Ohio Revised Code:

Section 392901 (A)

Accident & Health Multiple Penl - Farmowners
Aircraft Muluiple Penil - Homcowners
Altied Lines Oeean Marnine

Boiler & Machnery Other Liability

Burglary & Theft Private Passenger Auto - Liabiluy
Commercial Auto - Liability Private Passenger Auto - No l-';Ju-h
Cammercial Aute - No Fault Private Passenger Auto - Physical Damage
Commercial Auto - Physical Damage Surety

Credit Workers Compensation

Earthqua

Fidehty

Financial Guaranty

Fire

Glass

Inland Marine
Medical Malpractice
Multiple Perif - Commercial

TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY OF AMERICA cerified in its annual statement 1o this
Drepartment as of December 31,2020 that 1t has admmtted assets in the amount of $4,625.889.627. liabilities in the
amaunt of 82534855020, and surplus of at least $2.0971.034.607

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | huve hereunto subseribed my namie and caused my seal to be affixed at Cotumbus, Ohio,
this day and date.

St L frenet

Ludith French, Director

INST232Rev 62003) Accredited by the Nattonal of 5 (HAIC)




Bonded

C H EMiCIA l..fS PROJECT NAME: ‘hemicals &

CONTRACT NO.: _Chemicals 2002

w the Calendar Year 2022

Inc.

PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX
CERTIFICATION
REQUIRED BY OHIO REVISED CODE
SECTION 5719.042

FINANCE DIRECTOR

CITY OF SANDUSKY

Bonded Chemicals. Ing

BIDDER'S NAME

STATE OF __ Ul

COUNTY OF _rankin 8S:

THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY CERTIFIES THAT THE BIDDER TO WHOM CONTRACT
AWARD IS BEING CONSIDERED WAS NOT CHARGED WITH ANY DELINQUENT
PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX ON THE GENERAL TAX LIST OF PERSONAL PROPERTY
FOR ANY COUNTY IN THE STATE OF OHIO AT THE TIME THE BID WAS SUBMITTED
FOR THE ABOVE-REFERENCED CONTRACT.

NAME;

NAME: Paul W. Cochran
(PRINTED)

TITLE:_ General Manager

STATE OF =y
COUNTY OF FréqnZiis) SS:
SWORN TO BEFORE ME AND SUBSCRIBED IN MY PRESENCE THIS 42 DAY
OF __ Qetdoec 20 (. s
S L, f
W2\ cyNTHIA MARTINEZ NOTARY PUBLIC

My Commission Expires
AFFIDA¥FIEIS TO BE REPRODUCED ON THE BIDDER'S
RHEAD AND SIGNED BY THE APPROPRIATE
SIGNATORY BEFORE A NOTARY PUBLIC.

|SIDO3IR.DOCA} CITY-IB-19

CITY OF SANDUSKY
BIDDER'S AFFIDAVIT

[NOTE:  THIS AFFIDAVIT IS TO BE REPRODUCED ON THE BIDDER'S LETTERHEAD
AND SIGNED BY THE APPROPRIATE SIGNATORY BEFORE A NOTARY
PUBLIC. CROSS OUT EITHER PARAGRAPH 3 OR 4, WHICHEVER 1S NOT
APPLICABLE. 1F PARAGRAPH 3 IS NOT CROSSED OUT, EXHIBIT A MUST
BE COMPLETED AND ATTACHED TO NAME AND DESCRIBE THE
INTERESTS OF ALL RELATED PERSONS.]

PROJECT NAME: _Chemicals {or the Calendar vear 2022
CONTRACT: _Chemicals 2027

ETHICS CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO OHIO
REVISED CODE SECTIONS 9.24, 102,03, 102.04,
2921.42 AND 351713

DIRECTOR OF ENGINEERING SERVICES
CITY OF SANDUSKY

HBanded Chemicals, I,
BIDDER'S NAME

STATE OF _Ohio

COUNTY OF _frankhn §8:

The undersigned being duly sworn, deposes and states as follows:

1 The undersigned is duly authorized to make the statements herein on behalt of the
Bidder.

2. No unresolved finding for recovery has been issued against the Bidder by the
Auditor of State.

3 No official or employee of the City of Sandusky is officer, director. trusice.
shareholder, partner. member or owner of the Bidder (each. a “Related Person™), or is a business
associate or a member of the family of the Bidder or a Related Person.

4, An official or an employee of the City of Sandusky is an officer, director, trustec,
shareholder. partner. member or owner (each, a “Related Person”) of the Bidder, or is a business
associate or a member of the family of the Bidder or Related Person, but

a the subject of the Contract is necessary supplies or services for the City of

AT RC2 CITY-BA-1




Sandusky:

b. the supplies or services are unobtainnble clsewhere for the same or lower

cost, or are being furnished to the City of Sandusky as part of a continuing
of dealing established prior to the Related Person becoming a City
official or employee;

c. the treatment accorded the City of Sandusky is either preferential to or the
same as that accorded other customers of the Bidder in simitar
transactions;

d. the entire transaction resulting in the Contract has been conducted at arms-
length, with full knowlcdge by the City of the interest of the Related
Persons as described in Exhibit A attached hereto: and

e the Related Person has taken no part in the deliberations or decision of the

City with respect to the Contract.

3. ‘The Bidder is a/an (sclect one):
O Individual, partnership, or other unincorporated busi association (including a
professional intion organized under Ohio Revised Code Chapter 1785).
estate. or trust.

@ Corporation organized and existing under the laws of the State of _Kentucky -
£} Labor organization.

6. ‘The undersigned hereby affirms that the Bidder and each of the individuals
specificd in Section 3517.13(1)3), ORC. (with respect to non-corporate entities and labor
organizations) or Section 3517.13(U)(3), ORC, (with respect to corporations) are in full
compliance with the political contributions fimitations set forth in Sections 3517.13(1) and (J).
ORC. as applicable. | understand that a false representation on this certification constitutes a
felony of the fifth degrec pursuant to Sections 3517.13(AA) and 3517.992(R)(3). ORC. Any
contract that contains a falsified certification shall be rescinded

NAME: @u/' MM .

(SIGNATURE)

NAME: _Paui W s
(PRINTED)

@W‘ TITLE: _General Manager

STATE OF D

COUNTY OF rnlhis g

Sworn to before me and subscribed in my presence this, QZ;;' M . ZQQ‘/.

NOTARY PUBLICO 5/

CITY OF SANDUSKY
BIDDER'S AFFIDAVIT
EXHIBIT A

Project Name: Chemicals Tor the Calendar Year 2022

C Chemicals 2022

Bidder's Name: __Bonded Chemicals. Inc.

Related official/public employee:
Name: Paul W. Cochran
Title/Position: (feneral Manager

Relation to Bidder: (iencral Manager

(OUISIT2INK 2 CITY-BA-3




CITY OF SANDUSKY
BIDDER’S AFFIDAVIT #2

CONTRACT NAME: _ Chemicals 2022

LOBBYING AND CAMPAIGN
FINANCING CERTIFICATION

DIRECTOR OF ENGINEERING SERVICES
CITY OF SANDUSKY

Bonded Chenicals, Inc. -

BIDDER’'S NAME
STATEQOF __Qbio oo
COUNTY OF _ Franklin -

The undersigned herchy certifies as follows:

1. The Bidder is and will remain in compliance with the requirements of Scctions 101.70
and 121.60 at sey. of the Ohio Revised Code relating to lobbying.

2. The Bidder is and will remain in compliance with Chapter 3517 of the Ohio Revised
Code, Campaign Financing, including that all applicable parties listed in division (1)(3) (with
respect 1o non-corporate entities and labor organizations) or (J)(3) (with respect to corporations)
are in full compliance with divisions (ix1) and (1)(1) of the Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13.

NAME: @/‘IJ . Mw

(SIGNATURE)

NAME: _Paul W Cochgan

(PRINTED

TITLE: _General Manager

CITY-BA2-1

STATE OF ‘ ;zl Vi a S
county oF & {2ude i ss

RE, WSUBSCRIB IN MY_PRESENCE THIS })ﬁ\
e 2, .

Iz
CYNTHIA MARTINEZ o

Notary Public, Stats of Ohio NO1&V PUBLIC —~
i¥1 ™y Commission Expires
LEFIDAVIVI¥ED BE REPRODUCED ON THE BIDDER’S
FIBKHEAD AND SIGNED BY THE APPROPRIATE

SIGNATORY BEFORE A NOTARY PUBLIC.

CITY-BA2-2




CITY OF SANDUSKY

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
STATEOF _ Ohwno )
} ss:
COUNTY OF __Erankiw }

The undersigned hereby certifies as follows:

(1) The bid to the City of Sandusky, Ohio, submitted by the Bidder on __10/14/202¢

in accordance with the Contrect De ts dated 972372021 (the “Bid™)
has been prepared by the Bidder without collusion or fraud with any Person.

(2) The Bid is not made in the interest of or on behalf of any undisclosed Person.

(3) The Base Bid, any Unit Price and any Alternate bid in the Bid have been arrived at
independently without collusion, consuitation, communication or agreement, or for the purpose
of restricting competition as to any matter relating to such Bese Bid, Unit Price or Alternate with
any other Bidder.

(4) Unless otherwise required by law, the Base Bid, any Unit Price and any Altemate bid in the
Bid have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder and will not be knowingly disclosed by the
Bidder prior to the bid opening, directly or indirectly, to any other Bidder who would have any
interest in the Base Bid, Unit Price or Alternate bid.

{5) No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder to induce any other Person to
submit or not to submit a bid for the purpose of restricting competition.

Date:  Uctober 12 20 2! Bonded Chemicals, Joc.
(Name of Bidder)
By:{_, y . >
Signature of person authorized to bind
the Bidder
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STATE OP Ohio )
™
COUNTY OF _ krankiin )
o [Biror _
SWQRN [O,BEFO! w SUBSCRIBED IN MY PRESENCE THIS AY OF
2 .
) 2

S AP
W2\ CyNTHIA MARTINEZ A b—

Notary ?uby \r—\
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